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END-USER LICENSE AGREEMENT 
 
This End-User License Agreement (“Terms”) shall apply to MagiCAD Quantity software in object code 
form and any related documentation (“Product”) ordered and made available to the licensee by 
MagiCAD Group Oy* (“MAGICAD GROUP”). You as either the licensee or a permitted person user 
(“you”) agree to be legally bound by these Terms by selecting the ‘I accept the terms in the license 
agreement’ option or by using the Product. If you do not agree to these Terms, select the ‘I do not accept 
the terms in the license agreement’ option and do not use the Product. 
 
* MagiCAD Quantity is licensed to the licensee in China by Glodon Company Limited. 
 
GENERAL 
 
You may download an evaluation version of the Product, in which case you are entitled only to evaluate 
the Product before purchasing a commercial version of the Product. 
 
You shall be responsible for acquiring at your own expense all necessary third party software, equipment, 
and telecommunications required for using the Product. 
 
The Product, is neither intended nor fit for the use of consumers but businesses and non-profit 
organizations only. Furthermore, the Product is not designed to be fault-tolerant and therefore it is not 
intended to be used for the purposes of hazardous environments.  
 
For the avoidance of doubt, any calculations, data, or other results generated from the usage of the 
Product are for the references only and must be checked by you. Neither MagiCAD Group nor any 
supplier of MagiCAD Group shall be responsible for the reliability and validity of the results, as it is your 
responsibility to ensure the results are correct. 
 
LICENSES OF EVALUATION VERSION, EDUCATIONAL VERSION, COMMERCIAL VERSION AND 
DEMONSTRATION AND TRAINING VERSION 
 
You shall have a limited, non-exclusive and non-transferable right to install and use the Product. You 
are entitled to make and install several copies of the Product provided that having several copies is 
justifiable for the customary use of the Product. All such copies must include notices concerning the 
copyright and other rights of MAGICAD GROUP. 
 
If you have downloaded an evaluation version of the Product, you are entitled to use the Product, free-
of-charge, strictly for the sole purpose of evaluating the features and usability of the Product, during a 
separately specified license period. 
 
The educational version of the Product is intended for (i) educational Institutions, (ii) students, (iii) other 
educational licensee authorized by MAGICAD GROUP. If you have downloaded an educational version 
of the Product as an educational Institution or other educational licensee authorized by MAGICAD 
GROUP, you are entitled to use the Product, subject to the payment of applicable license fees, strictly 
within one Institution and only for the Educational purposes of such institution, during a separately 
specified license period and for such maximum number of simultaneous person users you have 
purchased licenses for. Students are entitled to use the Product only for the Educational purposes during 
a separately specified license period. Students may be required to proof their enrolments to educational 
Institutions or otherwise are to be approved by MAGICAD GROUP.  The features and functionalities of 
the educational version of the Product may differ from the features and functionalities of the commercial 
version of the Product. For the purposes of this clause, “Institution” means a degree-granting or 
certificate-granting educational Institution; “person user” means the student or faculty member of the 
Institution;  "Student” means an individual person enrolled as a student at educational Institution, and 
“Educational purposes” mean internal education activities, which exclude all commercial or for-profit 
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instructional or other purposes, and which are carried out only at and from such locations that are not 
operated for commercial or for-profit purposes. 
 
If you have downloaded a commercial version of the Product, you are entitled to use the Product, subject 
to the payment of applicable license fees, strictly within one legal entity identified by its individual 
company ID and only for the internal business purposes of such entity, during a separately specified 
license period and for such maximum number of simultaneous person users you have purchased 
licenses for. 
 
MAGICAD GROUP’s authorized Resellers, Manufacturers, who order product data services from 
MAGICAD GROUP, or other Partners and Agents, may obtain Demonstration and Training version, 
which you can use to demonstrate the Product, test product data services results, sell your solutions, 
and train employees. However, these licenses must not be resold or used for direct revenue-generating 
activities (excluding customer trainings), commercial purposes (excluding customer trainings), or 
personal purposes.  
  
After the license period has expired, the Product may disable itself automatically, and you shall 
discontinue using the Product and destroy the software copy you have installed. However, subject to 
the availability of the Product, you may purchase a (new) commercial version of the Product, or an 
educational version if applicable. 
 
You shall not (i) modify, work around any technical limitations, decompile, disassemble, reverse-
engineer, or otherwise endeavour to examine the function or structure of the Product, or create 
derivative works based on the Product, or use detached files, libraries or other parts of the Product in 
connection with third party software unless expressly permissible under the Product specifications; or 
(ii) assign, transfer, sublicense, rent, pledge, or otherwise distribute or make available, the Product or 
your limited right to use the Product; save to the extent that is otherwise expressly provided for by 
mandatory provisions of applicable law. 
 
TERRITORY 
 
MAGICAD GROUP grants licenses only for the use on Territory stated in the delivery agreement. 
Nothing in these Terms permits you to install or access the Product outside of the Territory (including, 
without limitation, use of virtual machines or other technology). 
 
LIMITED WARRANTY AND DISCLAMERS 
 
MAGICAD GROUP guarantees the performance of the Product in its intended use as specified in the 
related documentation. The warranty is valid for a sixty (60) days warranty period as of the day of 
delivery. MAGICAD GROUP shall correct the errors by replacing any defective versions of the Product 
with a new update version or a service pack version. Alternatively, MAGICAD GROUP can provide a 
work-around if it does not cause unreasonable inconvenience for you. 
 
The warranty is not applicable to any defect or deficiency that results from (i) the use of the Product 
contrary to MAGICAD GROUP’s written instructions such as requirements on the operating environment, 
(ii) any modification taken without MAGICAD GROUP’s authorisation or (iii) the use of the Product in 
combination with any product or service not supplied or authorized by MAGICAD GROUP. 
 
SUPPORT 
 
MAGICAD GROUP may but is not obliged to provide you with maintenance, support or other consulting 
services, or bug fixes or upgrades of the Product. 
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However, if you have purchased and duly paid for the commercial version of the Product, MAGICAD 
GROUP shall provide you from time to time free-of-charge with service releases containing minor 
corrections to the latest released version of the Product. 
 
PROPERTY RIGHTS AND CONFIDENTIALITY 
 
Title, ownership and all intellectual property rights to the Product belong exclusively to MAGICAD 
GROUP or any supplier of MAGICAD GROUP. You are granted only a limited right to use the Product. 
Aspects of the Product, including the specific design and structure, and license activation codes enabling 
the use of the Product, are confidential and trade secrets of MAGICAD GROUP or any supplier of 
MAGICAD GROUP. You shall maintain such information as strictly confidential, and shall not disclose 
them to any third party or use them for any unauthorized purpose. These confidentiality obligations 
remain in force even after your right to use the Product has ended. 
 
LIMITED LIABILITY 
 
Due to the fact that the Product is licensed to you strictly on an “AS IS” basis, to the maximum event 
permitted by the applicable law neither MAGICAD GROUP nor any supplier of MAGICAD GROUP shall 
be liable for any damages whatsoever, including but without limitation to direct, indirect, special, 
consequential, punitive or incidental damages, and loss of revenue, profit or data. In any case the 
maximum liability of MAGICAD GROUP shall be equal to the amount paid by you for the right to use the 
Product. 
 
These limitations of liability constitute an essential part of these Terms. 
 
LAWS AND FORUM 
 
Your right to use the Product and these Terms shall be governed by substantial laws of Finland. Any 
and all disputes arising out of these Terms shall be intended to be settled amicably. In case an amicable 
settlement is not reached, the dispute shall be submitted to the District Court of Helsinki, Finland. 
Please note that you must use the Product in compliance with applicable export and import laws, 
regulations and rules. 
 
TERMINATION OF LICENSE 
 
Either MAGICAD GROUP or you may terminate with immediate effect these Terms and the License 
granted hereunder if: 
 
The other party is in material breach of any of its obligations or: 
 
the other party (i) goes into liquidation, or (ii) any proceeding is instituted seeking to adjudicate the other 
Party as bankrupt or insolvent, or (iii) has a receiver appointed in respect of any of its assets, or (iv) if 
the other party is a partnership, if any of the partners in the partnership is adjudicated bankrupt or 
executes an assignment for the benefit of his/its or their creditors or otherwise compounded with his/its 
or their creditors, or (v) becomes subject to any similar act or process in any other jurisdiction, or (vi) 
becomes generally unable to pay its debts as and when they fall due. 
 
ENTIRE AGREEMENT AND AMENDMENTS 
 
These Terms are an integral part of the agreement between you and MAGICAD GROUP with regard to 
the use of the Product, and shall supersede any previous written or oral agreements and understandings. 
Any and all amendments to these Terms shall be made in writing and expressly accepted by both you 
and MAGICAD GROUP. 
 


